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A YOUNG FATHER IS GUNNED DOWN IN BROAD DAYLIGHT — JUST DAYS AFTER A 
MYSTERIOUS PERSON IS SEEN LURKING OUTSIDE HIS HOME — ‘20/20’ INVESTIGATES 

THE MURDER THAT GRIPPED ATLANTA 
 

Co-Anchor Deborah Roberts’ Report on the Death of Rusty Sneiderman Airs Friday, Nov. 15, and 
Streams Next Day on Hulu 
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It was one of the most notorious murders in the Atlanta area when a father was gunned down while 
dropping his young son off at preschool just days after a mysterious person was seen lurking outside 
his home with a gun. Co-anchor Deborah Roberts investigates the murder of Rusty Sneiderman in an 
all-new, gripping episode of “20/20,” Friday, Nov. 15 (9:01-11:00 p.m. EST) on ABC, and streaming 
next day on Hulu. 
 
Loving father and successful entrepreneur Rusty Sneiderman was living in the Atlanta suburb of 
Dunwoody, Georgia, with his wife, Andrea, and two young children. But everything would change 
when one morning, just moments after dropping his son off, Rusty was ambushed and gunned down 
in the parking lot. 
 
The case captivated the nation as an extensive investigation led to the mystery gunman, Hemy 
Neuman. Authorities were shocked to discover that Hemy was Andrea’s supervisor at work. The trial 
would include an insanity defense from Hemy, with the suggestion that a demon who sounded like 
the singer Barry White encouraged him to commit the murder, and questions about the nature of the 
relationship between Andrea and Hemy.  
 
“20/20” shares new evidence on the case that rocked the Atlanta suburb, as well as police interviews 
with Hemy and Andrea and interviews with Andrew Thompson, former Dunwoody detective; Robert 
James, former DeKalb County district attorney; Jodie Fleischer, former WSB-TV reporter; Rusty’s 
friends Steve Kirschner and Josh Golub; J. Tom Morgan, Andrea Sneiderman’s attorney; former 

https://www.hulu.com/welcome


reporter Mike Petchenik; Rusty’s father Donald Sneiderman and brother Steve Sneiderman; and Mark 
Potter, former DeKalb County district attorney investigator.  
 
ABC News’ “20/20” is an award-winning primetime program anchored by David Muir and Deborah 
Roberts. A proven leader as a long-form newsmagazine for over 45 years, “20/20” features 
unforgettable, character-driven true-crime mysteries, exclusive newsmaker interviews, hard-hitting 
investigative reports and in-depth coverage of high-profile stories. Janice Johnston is the executive 
producer. The two-hour “20/20” events air Fridays from 9:01-11:00 p.m. EST on ABC and are available 
to stream on ABC News digital platforms and Hulu. 
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